
THE CITY OF TORONTO 
 

Minutes of the Bid Committee 
 

Meeting 18 
 

Wednesday, May 3, 2006 
 
The Bid Committee met on Wednesday, May 3, 2006, in Meeting Room D, 2nd Floor, 
City Hall, commencing at 2:02 p.m. 
 
Members Present: 
 
  Linda Reid, obo City Clerk 
  Don Altman, obo Deputy City Manager and Chief Financial Officer 
  Laurie McQueen, obo City Manager 
  Frank Csenkey, Toronto Water 
  Brian Alford, Technical Services 
  Alex Marich, Toronto Water 
  George Parcalidis, Facilities and Real Estate 

There were no declarations of interest pursuant to the Municipal Conflict of Interest Act. 

Confirmation of Minutes 
 
 On motion by Don Altman, the minutes of the meeting of the 

Bid Committee held on April 26, 2006, were confirmed. 
 
 
18. 1 Contract 06SC-320WP- Tender Call 65-2006 - CCTV Inspection and Cleaning of 

Municipal Sewers at Various Locations in the Scarborough District 
 
 The Bid Committee considered a report (April 18, 2006) from the General Manager of 

Toronto Water and the Acting Director of Purchasing and Materials Management, 
advising on the results of the Tender 65-2006, issued for CCTV Inspection and Cleaning 
of Municipal Sewers at Various Locations in the Scarborough District, in accordance 
with specifications as required by Toronto Water, and requesting authority to award a 
contract to the recommended bidder. 

 
 Recommendation: 
 
 It is recommended that authority be granted to award Contract 06SC-320WP, Tender 

Call 65-2006, for CCTV Inspection and Cleaning of Municipal Sewers at Various 
Locations in Scarborough District, to Sarp Toronto Inc., in the amount of $588,302.05 
including all taxes and charges. 
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 On motion by Frank Csenkey, the Bid Committee adopted the staff 

recommendation in the Recommendation Section of the report.  
 
 
18.2 Contract 06TE-310WS- Tender Call 33-2006 - Cleaning and Cement Mortar Lining 

of Existing Water Mains at Various Locations in Toronto and East York District 
 
 The Bid Committee considered a report (April 18, 2006) from the General Manager of 

Toronto Water and the Acting Director of Purchasing and Materials Management, 
advising on the results of the Tender 33-2006, issued for Cleaning and Cement Mortar 
Lining of Existing Water Mains at Various Locations in Toronto and East York District, 
in accordance with specifications as required by Toronto Water, and requesting authority 
to award a contract to the recommended bidder. 

 
 Recommendation: 
 
 It is recommended that authority be granted to award Contract 06TE-310WS, Tender 

Call 33-2006, for Cleaning and Cement Mortar Lining of Existing Water Mains at 
Various Locations in Toronto and East York, to Fer-Pal Construction Ltd., in the amount 
of $2,277,013.50 including all taxes and charges. 

 
 On motion by Frank Csenkey, the Bid Committee adopted the staff 

recommendation in the Recommendation Section of the report.  
 
 
18.3 Contract 06SC-114TR, Tender Call 58-2006 - Local Road Resurfacing (Wards 37, 

39 and 42 - Scarborough District) 
 
 The Bid Committee considered a report (April 19, 2006) from the General Manager of 

Transportation Services and the Manager of Goods and Services, Purchasing and 
Materials Management, advising on the results of the Tender 58-2006, issued for Local 
Road Resurfacing, Scarborough District, in accordance with specifications as required by 
the Transportation Services Division, and requesting the authority to award a contract to 
the recommended bidder. 

 
 Recommendation: 
 
 It is recommended that authority be granted to award Contract 06SC-114TR, Tender Call 

58-2006, for Local Road Resurfacing, Wards 37, 39 and 42, Scarborough District, to 
D. Crupi & Sons Limited, in the total amount of $1,655,055.78 including all taxes and 
charges. 

 
 On motion by Brian Alford, the Bid Committee adopted the staff 

recommendation in the Recommendation Section of the report.  
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18.4 Automated Meter Reading System Request for Proposal 0729-05-7287 (All Wards) 
 
 The Bid Committee considered a report (April 26, 2006) from the General Manager of 

Toronto Water and the Acting Director of Purchasing and Materials Management, 
advising on the results of the Request for Proposal (RFP) 0729-05-7287, for the Meter 
Replacement and Automated Meter Reading System RFP Development and Contract 
Management and requesting authority to award a contract and enter into an agreement 
with the recommended proponent. 

 
 Recommendation: 
 
 It is recommended that authority be granted to award a contract to EMA Canada Inc., in 

the amount of $4,201,536.90 including all applicable taxes and charges to provide 
professional services to develop an RFP for meter replacment and an automated meter 
reading sytem. 

 
 On motion by Alex Marich, the Bid Committee adopted the staff 

recommendation in the Recommendation Section of the report.  
 
 
18.5 Tender Call 12-2006 - Concrete Repairs to Underground Parking Garage at 2 Civic 

Centre Court (Ward 3 - Etobicoke Centre) 
 
 The Bid Committee considered a report (April 25, 2006) from the Acting Director of 

Purchasing and Materials Management, advising on the results of the Tender issued for 
the Concrete Repairs to Underground Parking Garage at 2 Civic Centre Court, in 
accordance with specifications as required by Facilities and Real Estate and requesting 
the authority to award a contract to the recommended bidder. 

 
 Recommendation: 
 
 It is recommended that authority be granted to award Tender Call 12-2006, for Concrete 

Repairs to Underground Parking Garage at 2 Civic Centre Court, to Across Canada 
Construction, in the amount of $599,246.01 including all taxes and charges. 

 
 On motion by George Parcalidis, the Bid Committee adopted the staff 

recommendation in the Recommendation Section of the report.  
 
 
18.6 Contract 06TE-40WP, Tender Call 85-2006 - Construction of a Combined Sewer on 

Dupont Street from Davenport Road to Avenue Road, (Ward 20 - Trinity-Spadina) 
 
 The Bid Committee considered a report (April 25, 2006) from the Executive Director of 

Technical Services and the Acting Director of Purchasing and Materials Management, 
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advising on the results of the Tender issued for the construction of a combined sewer on 
Dupont Street from Davenport Road to Avenue Road, in accordance with specifications 
as required by Technical Services, and requesting authority to award a contract to the 
recommended bidder. 

 
 Recommendation: 
 
 It is recommended that authority be granted to award Contract 06TE-40WP, Tender Call 

85-2006 to Co-X-Co Construction Limited., in the amount of $936,506.80, including all 
applicable taxes and charges, for the construction of a combined sewer on Dupont Street 
from Davenport Road to Avenue Road. 

 
 On motion by Don Altman, the Bid Committee adopted the staff 

recommendation in the Recommendation Section of the report.  
 
 
The Bid Committee adjourned its meeting at 2:06 p.m. 
 
  _______________________ 

 Chair. 


