
Authority: Notice of Motion J(20), moved by Councillor Mihevc, seconded by Councillor Jones,
as adopted by City of Toronto Council on June 26, 27 and 28, 2001

Enacted by Council: June 28, 2001

CITY OF TORONTO

BY-LAW No. 597-2001

To amend City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 349, Animals, to amend dog licence
fees and cat registration fees.

WHEREAS Section 210 of the Municipal Act authorizes a municipality to pass by-laws respecting
animals and birds; and

WHEREAS section 210.1 of the Municipal Act authorizes a municipality to pass by-laws imposing
fees or charges on any class of persons;

The Council of the City of Toronto HEREBY ENACTS as follows:

1. Chapter 349, Animals, of the City of Toronto Municipal Code is amended as follows:

A. The dog licence fees in column 3, Fees in Schedule C are amended:

(1) By deleting the figure “$35.00 (1 yr.)”for an unaltered dog and substituting
the figure “$50.00”.

(2) By deleting the figure “$140.00 (5yrs.)” for an unaltered dog.

(3) By deleting the figure “$75.00 (5 yrs.)” for a dog identified with a microchip.

(4) By deleting the words and figures “$50.00 (5 yrs.) if senior citizen” for a dog
identified with a microchip.

(5) By deleting the figure “$50.00 (5yrs.)” for a dog that is spayed or neutered.

(6) By deleting the words “No fee if senior citizen” for a dog that is spayed or
neutered and substituting the figure “$10.00”.

(7) By deleting the words “No fee” for a dog that is spayed or neutered with a
microchip and substituting the figure “$10.00”.

B. The cat registration fees in column 3, Fees in Schedule D are amended:

(1) By deleting the figure “$35.00 (1 yr.)” for an unaltered cat and substituting
the figure “$50.00”.

(2) By deleting the figure “$140.00 (5yrs.)” for an unaltered cat.



2
City of Toronto By-law No. 597-2001

(3) By deleting the figure “$75.00 (5 yrs.)” for a cat that is identified with a
microchip.

(4) By deleting the words and figures “$50.00 (5yrs.) if senior citizen” for a cat
identified with a microchip.

(5) By deleting the figure “$50.00 (5 yrs.)” for a cat that is spayed or neutered.

(6) By deleting the words “No fee if senior citizen” for a cat that is spayed or
neutered and substituting the figure “$10.00”.

(7) By deleting the words “No fee” for a cat that is spayed or neutered and
identified with a microchip” and substituting the figure “$10.00”.

ENACTED AND PASSED this 28th day of June, A.D. 2001.

CASE OOTES, JEFFREY A. ABRAMS,       
            Deputy Mayor Acting City Clerk

(Corporate Seal)


