
Authority: Planning and Transportation Committee Report No. 2, Clause No. 2,
as adopted by City of Toronto Council on February 13, 14 and 15, 2002

Enacted by Council: February 15, 2002

CITY OF TORONTO

BY-LAW No. 88-2002

To amend Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees, to increase sign permit fees.

The Council of the City of Toronto HEREBY ENACTS as follows:

1. Chapter 441, Fees, of the City of Toronto Municipal Code is amended as follows:

A. Subsection 441-9A(1) is amended by deleting “$20” and substituting “$25”.

B. Subsection 441-9A(1) is further amended by deleting “$150” and substituting
“$175”.

C. Subsection 441-9A(2) is amended by deleting “$25” and substituting “$30”.

D. Subsection 441-9A(2) is further amended by deleting “$150” and substituting
“$175”.

E. Subsection 441-9A(3) is amended by deleting “$150” and substituting “$175”.

ENACTED AND PASSED this 15th day of February, A.D. 2002.

CASE OOTES, ULLI S. WATKISS       
            Deputy Mayor City Clerk

(Corporate Seal)


