
Authority: Policy and Finance Committee Report 2, Clause 1, 
adopted as amended, by City of Toronto Council on March 29 and 30, 2006 

Enacted by Council: March 30, 2006 
 

CITY OF TORONTO 
 

BY-LAW No. 223-2006 
 

To amend Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees, to increase the fee for 
the registration of a birth. 

 
WHEREAS under section 391 of the Municipal Act, 2001, a municipality may pass by-laws 
imposing fees or charges on any class of persons for services or activities provided or done by or 
on behalf of it; and 
 
WHEREAS in its approval of the operating budget, Council has approved an increase in the fee 
for the registration of a birth from $27.50 to $35; and 
 
WHEREAS in its approval of the operating budget, Council has approved an increase in the fee 
for a division registrar statement from $25 to $35; 
 
The Council of the City of Toronto HEREBY ENACTS as follows: 
 
1. Section 441-4A(1) of Chapter 441, Fees, of The City of Toronto Municipal Code is 

amended by deleting “$27.50” and substituting “$35”. 
 
2. Section 441-4A(3) of Chapter 441, Fees, of The City of Toronto Municipal Code is 

amended by deleting “$25” and substituting “$35”. 
 
3. This by-law comes into force on July 1, 2006. 
 
ENACTED AND PASSED this 30th day of March, A.D. 2006. 
 
DAVID R. MILLER, ULLI S. WATKISS        
                          Mayor City Clerk 
 
(Corporate Seal) 
 
 


