
Authority:  Executive Committee Item EX13.2 adopted as 
amended, by City of Toronto Council on February 19, 2020 

CITY OF TORONTO 
 

BY-LAW 127-2022 
 

To amend City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 841, Waste Collection, Commercial 
Properties, and Chapter 844, Waste Collection, Residential Properties, to phase out annual 
garbage rebates for residential curbside collection. 
 
Whereas authority is given to Council to adopt by-laws concerning property tax rebates; and 
 
Whereas Council, through its annual budget process meeting of February 19, 2020 adopted 
adjustments to phase out the 2020 solid waste rebate for single family and residential units above 
commercial customers; and 
 
Whereas it is necessary to update Municipal Code Chapter 841, Waste Collection, Commercial 
Properties, and Municipal Code Chapter 844, Waste Collection, Residential Properties, to reflect 
the changes to the annual garbage rebates for residential curbside collection approved by 
Council; 
 
The Council of the City of Toronto enacts: 
 
1. Schedule G to Chapter 841, Waste Collection, Commercial Properties is amended as 

follows: 
 

a. by deleting "$160.04" and inserting "$80.59"; and 
 

b. by deleting "$73.69" and inserting "$0.00". 
 
2. Schedule D to Chapter 844, Waste Collection, Residential Properties is amended as 

follows: 
 

a. by deleting "$160.04" and inserting "$80.59"; and 
 

b. by deleting "$73.69" and inserting "$0.00". 
 

Enacted and passed on February 17, 2022. 

Frances Nunziata, John D. Elvidge, 
 Speaker City Clerk 
 
(Seal of the City) 


	CITY OF TORONTO

		2022-02-24T11:43:48-0500
	City Clerk's Office -- City of Toronto




