
Authority: Administration Committee Report No. 5, Clause No. 12, 
as adopted by City of Toronto Council on July 20, 21 and 22, 2004 

Enacted by Council: June 16, 2005 
 

CITY OF TORONTO 
 

BY-LAW No. 536-2005 
 
To amend City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 693, Signs - Article II, Election Signs, 

to increase sign removal fees. 
 
WHEREAS Council may pass by-laws respecting structures, including fences and signs under 
paragraph 7 of subsection 11(1) of the Municipal Act, 2001; and 
 
WHEREAS section 99 of the Municipal Act, 2001 establishes rules that apply to a by-law of a 
municipality respecting advertising devices, including signs; and 
 
WHEREAS Council may pass by-laws imposing fees or charges on any class of persons for 
services or activities provided or done by or on behalf of the City under clause 391(1)(a) of the 
Municipal Act, 2001; and 
 
WHEREAS Council may pass by-laws respecting highways under paragraph 1 of 
subsection 11(1) of the Municipal Act, 2001; and 
 
WHEREAS notice of proposed amendments to Article II, Election Signs, Municipal Code, 
Chapter 693, Signs, was posted on the City of Toronto Web site on June 16, 2004 and interested 
persons were given an opportunity to be heard at a public meeting held on June 28, 2004; and 
 
WHEREAS recommendation 1(r) of Administration Committee Report 5, Clause 12, as adopted 
by City of Toronto Council on July 20, 21 and 22, 2004, among other matters recommended that 
Article II, Election Signs, Chapter 693, Signs, of The City of Toronto Municipal Code be 
amended so that the amount of the sign removal fee be increased from $20 to $25; 
 
The Council of the City of Toronto HEREBY ENACTS as follows: 
 
1. Article II, Election Signs, of Chapter 693, Signs, of The City of Toronto Municipal Code 

is amended as follows: 
 

A. Section 693-10B(1) is amended by deleting “$20” and substituting “$25”. 
 

B. Section 693-10C(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$20” and substituting “$25”. 
 
ENACTED AND PASSED this 16th day of June, A.D. 2005. 
 
DAVID R. MILLER, ULLI S. WATKISS        
                          Mayor City Clerk 
 
(Corporate Seal) 
 
 


