
Authority: Executive Committee Item 3.2, adopted as amended, 
by City of Toronto Council on February 23 and 24, 2011 

Enacted by Council: February 24, 2011 
 

CITY OF TORONTO 
 

BY-LAW No. 335-2011 

 
To amend City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees and Charges and 

Chapter 849, Water and Sewage Services and Utility Bill to reflect the 2011 water and 

wastewater consumption rates to be charged to metered and flat rate consumers and the 

water and wastewater service fees and charges, to set the water rebate for low-income 

seniors and low-income disabled persons and to make necessary related, formatting and 

organizational amendments to City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapters 441, 849, 851 

and 681. 
 
WHEREAS section 259 of the City of Toronto Act, 2006 provides that the City may pass by-laws 
imposing fees or charges on persons for services or activities provided or done by or on behalf of 
it; and 
 
WHEREAS City Council has the authority to pass this by-law pursuant to subsections 8 (1) and 
(2) and section 259 of the City of Toronto Act, 2006; and 
 
WHEREAS at its meeting of February 23 and 24, 2011 City Council approved the new water 
and wastewater consumption rates to be charged to metered and flat rate consumers effective 
March 1, 2011, public notice having been given, and approved the water rebate for eligible 
low-income seniors and disabled persons effective March 1, 2011; and 
 
WHEREAS at its meeting of February 23 and 24, 2011 City Council increased various water and 
wastewater service fees and charges through its annual budget process, public notice having been 
given, which necessitates an update and reorganization of the appendices and schedules of City 
of Toronto Municipal Code, Chapter 441, Fees and Charges related to water and wastewater; and 
 
WHEREAS Chapter 441 of The City of Toronto Municipal Code is the codified consolidated 
user fee by-law for the City of Toronto ("Municipal Code Chapter 441"); and 
 
WHEREAS Chapter 849 of The City of Toronto Municipal Code is the Water and Sewage 
Services and Utility Bill by-law for the City of Toronto ("Municipal Code Chapter 849"); and 
 
WHEREAS Chapter 851 of The City of Toronto Municipal Code is the Water Supply by-law for 
the City of Toronto ("Municipal Code Chapter 851"); and 
 
WHEREAS Chapter 681 of The City of Toronto Municipal Code is the Sewers by-law for the 
City of Toronto ("Municipal Code Chapter 681"); and 
 
WHEREAS it is necessary to amend Municipal Code Chapters 441 and 849 to reflect the new 
water and wastewater consumption rates and water and wastewater service fees and charges 
authorized by City Council, and to further amend Municipal Code Chapter 849 to reflect the 
water rebate for eligible low–income seniors and disabled persons effective March 1, 2011 and 
to make necessary related, formatting and organizational amendments to Municipal Code 



2 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 
Chapters 441, 849, 851 and 861 necessitated by City Council's decision at its meeting on 
February 23 and 24, 2011; 
 
The Council of the City of Toronto HEREBY ENACTS as follows: 
 
1. Appendix D – Schedule 1, Water & Sewer Service Rates - Revenue Services, of 

City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Items 1 to 52, inclusive, 
is deleted in its entirety and replaced with Schedule "A" to this By-law, and the title of  
"Appendix D - Schedule 1, Water & Sewer Service Rates – Revenue Services" 
is changed to "Appendix D – Schedule 1, Water & Wastewater Consumption Rates", 
as reflected in Schedule "A" to this By-law. 

 
2. Appendix A – Schedule 2, Water Services, of City of Toronto Municipal Code 

Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Items 1 to 26, inclusive, is deleted in its entirety and 
replaced with Schedule "B" to this By-law, and the title of "Appendix A – Schedule 2, 
Water Services" is changed to "Appendix D – Schedule 2, Water Services", as reflected 
in Schedule "B" to this By-law. 

 
3. Appendix A – Schedule 3, Wastewater Services, of City of Toronto Municipal Code 

Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Items 1 to 12, inclusive, is deleted in its entirety and 
replaced with Schedule "C" to this By-law, and the title of "Appendix A – Schedule 3, 
Wastewater Services" is changed to "Appendix D – Schedule 3, Wastewater Services", 
as reflected in Schedule "C" to this By-law. 

 
4. Chapter 849, Water and Sewage Services and Utility Bill, of The City of Toronto 

Municipal Code is amended by deleting the words "City of Toronto Municipal Code 
Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix D - Schedule 1, Water & Sewer Service Rates 
- Revenue Services" wherever they appear and replacing them with the words 
"City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix D – 
Schedule 1, Water & Wastewater Consumption Rates". 

 
5. Chapter 849, Water and Sewage Services and Utility Bill, of The City of Toronto 

Municipal Code is amended by deleting the words "City of Toronto Municipal Code 
Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix A – Schedule 2, Water Services" wherever 
they appear and replacing them with "City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, 
Fees and Charges, Appendix D – Schedule 2, Water Services". 

 
6. Chapter 849, Water and Sewage Services and Utility Bill, of The City of Toronto 

Municipal Code is amended by deleting the words "City of Toronto Municipal Code 
Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix A – Schedule 3, Wastewater Services" 
wherever they appear and replacing them with "City of Toronto Municipal Code 
Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix D – Schedule 3, Wastewater Services". 

 



3 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 
7. Section 849-17, Chapter 849, Water and Sewage Services and Utility Bill, of The 

City of Toronto Municipal Code is amended by deleting "28.6 percent" and replacing it 
with "30 percent" so that the section reads as follows: 

 
"The Block 2 Rate, as set out in City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees and 
Charges, Appendix D - Schedule 1, Water & Wastewater Consumption Rates, 
is available to an eligible industrial process water user for a property, or a portion thereof, 
assessed on the annual returned assessment roll in the industrial property tax class and is 
applicable to volume of water consumed over 6,000 cubic metres per year 
(6,000 m³/per year) of such use.  The Block 2 Rate shall be set at a rate representing a 
30 percent reduction from the Block 1 Rate, as set out in City of Toronto Municipal Code 
Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix D - Schedule 1, Water & Wastewater 
Consumption Rates, or at such other rate as determined by City Council from time to 
time." 

 
8. Section 849-14.2B, Chapter 849, Water and Sewage Services and Utility Bill, of The City 

of Toronto Municipal Code is amended by deleting "28.6 percent" and replacing it with 
"30 percent" so that the section reads as follows: 

 
"B. The water rebate shall be set at a rate representing a 30 percent reduction from the 

Block 1 Rate, as set out in The City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, 
Fees and Charges, Appendix D - Schedule 1, Water & Wastewater Consumption 
Rates, or at such other rate as determined by Council from time to time." 

 
9. Section 849-14.5D, Chapter 849, Water and Sewage Services and Utility Bill, of The 

City of Toronto Municipal Code is amended by deleting "$0.5890/per cubic metre for 
2010" and replacing it with "$0.6853/per cubic metre" so that the section reads as 
follows: 

 
"D. In any year, or eligible portion thereof, the water rebate or credit rate shall be 

calculated by the difference in the Block 1 Rate and Block 2 Rate, such rates 
being based on 'paid on or before the due date', applicable for the year or portion 
thereof in which the water rebate is being applied for, and such water rebate shall 
be at the rate of $0.6853/per cubic metre, or such other rate in other years as may 
be determined by City Council from time to time." 

 
10. Section 849-16, Chapter 849, Water and Sewage Services and Utility Bill, of The 

City of Toronto Municipal Code, is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the 
following: 

 
"Consumers in the City of Toronto shall pay the fees and charges with regard to the 
distribution and supply of water and the provision of water and sewer services and the 
rates and charges in relation thereto as set out in City of Toronto Municipal Code 
Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix D - Schedule 1, Water & Wastewater 
Consumption Rates and City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, 
Appendix D - Schedule 2, Water Services and Schedule 3, Wastewater Services." 

 



4 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 
11. Chapter 851, Water Supply, of The City of Toronto Municipal Code, is amended by 

deleting the words "Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix A - Schedule 2, 
Water Services" wherever they appear and replacing them with "Chapter 441, Fees and 
Charges, Appendix D – Schedule 2, Water Services". 

 
12. Chapter 681, Sewers, of The City of Toronto Municipal Code is amended by deleting the 

words "City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix A - 
Schedule 3, Wastewater Services" wherever they appear and replacing them with 
"City of Toronto Municipal Code Chapter 441, Fees and Charges, Appendix D – 
Schedule 3, Wastewater Services". 

 
13. This by-law comes into force on March 1, 2011. 
 
ENACTED AND PASSED this 24th day of February, A.D. 2011. 
 
FRANCES NUNZIATA, ULLI S. WATKISS        
                                 Speaker City Clerk 
 
(Corporate Seal) 
 
 



5 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 
SCHEDULE "A" 

 
 
 



6 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 

 
 



7 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 

 
 
 



8 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 

 
 
 



9 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 

 



10 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 
SCHEDULE "B" 

 
 
 



11 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 

 
 
 



12 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 

 



13 
City of Toronto By-law No. 335-2011 

 
SCHEDULE "C" 

 
 
 


